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WCRE ADDS TRIO OF NEW HIRES TO PHILADELPHIA/NEW JERSEY 
TEAM AND RELOCATES TO LOGAN SQUARE 

 
New Assignments and High Volume of Transactions Lead Commercial Real Estate Firm to  

Expand Further 
 
 

         
 

  

January 9, 2019​ – Marlton, NJ – Wolf Commercial Real Estate (WCRE) is pleased to announce 
the expansion and relocation of its Center City Philadelphia office, which includes the addition 
of three new team members serving southeastern Pennsylvania and Southern New Jersey. WCRE 
quickly outgrew its original Philadelphia office at 1601 Market Street, and has moved to 3 Logan 
Square, at 1717 Arch Street. 

The new team members are Kevin Coleman, who joins as chief sales officer and executive vice 
president, and new sales associates Tyler Martin and Mike Scanzano. They join a team that 
includes several well-known business leaders with deep roots in the city. Among them are Brian 
Propp, director of strategic relationships, Tony Banks, vice president, Anthony Mannino, senior 
consultant, and sales associates Mitchell Russell and Joseph Nassib. Each brings a unique skill 
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set, along with energy, passion, and the signature WCRE commitment to the community. 
Managing principal Jason Wolf and vice president and principal Chris Henderson, also assist the 
Philadelphia team. 

“We’ve been serving numerous clients in and around Center City for the past few years, and we 
have fully committed to expanding our presence here,” said Henderson. “This move will create 
more opportunities for our Philly team to network and collaborate with clients and partners, and 
to deepen our commitment to community initiatives.”  

More About WCRE's New Hires: 
 
Kevin Coleman​ ​is a 15-year industry veteran. His role will include sales management and 
leadership, and business development throughout the region, with a heavy focus on central New 
Jersey. Coleman will also play an active part in the recruitment of all new team members.  

Previously, Coleman served as a vice president of advisory services with Transwestern. During 
this time, he had the opportunity to work on behalf of office and industrial tenants, investors, and 
developers. From 2010-2016, Coleman served as director with Colliers International, working 
out of the Princeton, New Jersey office. He represented national, regional, and local companies 
with office, industrial, and healthcare requirements. Among many accomplishments, he was 
instrumental in helping to grow the Princeton office with the addition of a team of brokers.  

On joining WCRE, Coleman said, “Jason has worked very hard to build a strong brand in the 
region, and I am excited for the opportunity to leverage my diverse background to help the team 
grow to the next level of performance.” 

Tyler Martin​ is one of the firm’s two new sales associates. Martin is a former new business 
development representative in the fleet management industry who will be a valuable partner to 
clients seeking expertise in development and understanding the potential of a space. He will 
work closely with WCRE’s sales professionals to generate new business relationships and create 
opportunities for clients in Philadelphia and the suburbs. 

Before graduating a year early from Lynn University in Boca Raton, Florida, Martin was a 
member of the NCAA lacrosse team. He has continued his education by pursuing his MBA with 
a concentration in Finance at Saint Joseph’s University. His anticipated graduation is in May 
2019.  

In addition to his professional activities, Martin is an attackman for the Hungarian National 
Lacrosse Team. He competed with the team in the 2018 World Lacrosse Championships in 
Israel.  

Mike Scanzano​ also joins WCRE as a sales associate. He will focus​ on the Southern New Jersey 
market. Scanzano​ will specialize in sales and leasing, tenant and landlord representation, 
investment sales, and multi-family dwellings. 



Scanzano is an entrepreneur and former professional athlete. He played six years of professional 
baseball, ending his career in 2010 with the Camden Riversharks. After baseball, he took a sales 
position with the Southern Illinois Miners, an independent minor league team. Since 2015 
Scanzano is also the co-owner of Scanzano Sports in Cherry Hill, a baseball training center. He 
is r​esponsible for marketing and business development, building relationships in the community, 
and overall management. 

Mike is excited about the opportunity to join the team at WCRE and looks forward to utilizing 
his sales experience and professional relationships to expand the firm’s client base. 

Since its founding in 2012, WCRE has grown into a market leader in Southern New Jersey and 
southeastern Pennsylvania. The team has set a new standard in serving the needs of owners, 
tenants, and investors. The firm currently has more than 175 properties comprising 4.2 million 
square feet of office, retail, medical, industrial, flex, and investment property in the region under 
exclusive watch. 

Jason Wolf said, “I’m excited to have such talented new team members servicing our clients in 
the Philadelphia and South Jersey regions. Our people have always been our biggest asset and 
our biggest advantage in the marketplace.”  
 
About WCRE 
 
WCRE is a full-service commercial real estate brokerage and advisory firm specializing in 
office, retail, medical, industrial and investment properties in Southern New Jersey and the 
Philadelphia region. We provide a complete range of real estate services to commercial property 
owners, companies, banks, commercial loan servicers, and investors seeking the highest quality 
of service, proven expertise, and a total commitment to client-focused relationships. Through our 
intensive focus on our clients’ business goals, our commitment to the community, and our highly 
personal approach to client service, WCRE is creating a new culture and a higher standard. We 
go well beyond helping with property transactions and serve as a strategic partner invested in 
your long-term growth and success. 

Learn more about WCRE at ​www.wolfcre.com​, on Twitter & Instagram @WCRE1, and on 
Facebook at ​Wolf Commercial Real Estate, LLC​. Visit our blog pages at 
ww.southjerseyofficespace.com​, ​www.southjerseyindustrialspace.com​, 
www.southjerseymedicalspace.com​, ​www.southjerseyretailspace.com​, 
www.phillyofficespace.com​, ​www.phillyindustrialspace.com​, ​www.phillymedicalspace.com​ ​and 
www.phillyretailspace.com​.  
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